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MAJOR NEW TITLES THIS MONTH

Ahdar, Rex and Leigh, 
Ian, Religious Freedom in 
the Liberal State, Oxford 
Univ Press, HB, £60.00, 
0199253625
There is a growing recogni-
tion of the challenge that 
religions pose for pluralist, 
multicultural democracies. 
‘Fundamentalist’ beliefs and 
practices test the limits of re-
ligious freedom, and seem to 
contradict the very basis on 
which liberal states protect 
religious liberty. Religions, 
moreover, are often associ-
ated with intolerance and 
persecution, yet insist upon 
religious liberty for them-
selves. This book inverts 
these stereotypes by present-

ing a sustained critique of 
how religious liberty ought 
to be understood in liberal 
legal systems and develops 
an alternative, Christian re-
sponse.

affected nations. The book 
suggests that a particular 
type of global governance 
structure is necessary to have 
more efficient regulation of 
the international financial 
systems. 

Alexander, Kern; Dhumale, 
Rahul and Eatwell, John, 
Global Governance of Fi-
nancial Systems: Interna-
tional Regulation of System-
atic Risk, Oxford Univ Press, 
HB, £26.99, 0195166981
The book sets forth the eco-
nomic rationale for inter-
national financial regula-
tion and what role, if any, 
international regulation can 
play in effectively managing 
systemic risk while pro-
viding accountability to all 

Allen, Tom, Property and 
the Human Rights Act, Hart 
Publishing, HB, £40.00, 
1841132039

Ashworth, Andrew, Sentenc-
ing and Criminal Justice 4ed, 
Cambridge Univ Press, PB, 
£22.99, 0521674050
Providing unrivalled cover-
age of one of the most high-
profile stages in the criminal 
justice process, this book 
examines the key issues in 
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sentencing policy and prac-
tice. It provides an up-to-date 
account of the legislation on 
sentencing together with the 
ever-increasing amount of 
Court of Appeal Case Law. 
The law in relation to ele-
ments of the wider criminal 
justice system is examined, 
including the prison and 
probation services.  The aim 
of the book is to examine 
English sentencing law in 
its context, drawing not only 
upon legislation and the de-
cisions of the courts but also 
upon the findings of research 
and on theoretical justifica-
tions for punishment. This 
new edition has been exten-
sively revised to integrate the 
new laws introduced by the 
Criminal Justice Act 2003, 
which has brought sweep-
ing reforms into English 
sentencing. 

Aust, Anthony, Handbook 
of International Law, Cam-
bridge Univ Press, PB, 
£24.99, 0521530342
A concise account of in-
ternational law by an ex-
perienced practitioner, this 
book explains how states 
and international organisa-
tions, especially the United 
Nations, make and use in-
ternational law. The nature 
of international law and its 
fundamental concepts and 
principles are described. The 
difference and relationship 
between various areas of 
international law, which are 
often misunderstood (such 
as diplomatic and state im-
munity, and human rights and 
international humanitarian 
law) are clearly explained. 
The essence of new special-
ist areas of international law, 
relating to the environment, 
human rights and terrorism 

are discussed. Aust’s clear 
and accessible style makes 
the subject understandable 
to non-international lawyers, 
non-lawyers and students. 
Abundant references are 
provided to sources and other 
materials, including authori-
tative and useful websites. 

Banda, Fareda, Women, Law 
and Human Rights, Hart 
Publishing, HB, £25.00, 
1841131288
Africa, with its mix of stat-
ute, custom and religion is at 
the centre of the debate about 
law and its impact on gender 
relations. This is because of 
the centrality of the gender 
question and its impact on 
the cultural relativism de-
bate within human rights. 
It is therefore important to 
examine critically the role 
of law, broadly constructed, 
in African societies. The 
book focuses on women’s 
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experiences in the family. 
This is because the lives of 
women continue to be lived 
out largely in the private 
domain where the right to 
privacy is used to conceal 
unequal treatment of women 
which is justified by invoking 
“custom” and “tradition”. 
The book shows how law 
and its interpretation is used 
to disenfranchise women, 
resulting in their being de-
prived of land and other 
property which they may 
have helped to accumulate. 
It also considers issues of 
violence within the home 
and examines the issue of 
female genital cutting. A 
major theme of the book is a 
consideration of the linkages 
of constitutional and interna-
tional human rights norms 
with local values. This is 
done using feminist tools of 
analysis. The book considers 
the provisions of the Protocol 
to the African Charter on Hu-
man and People’s Rights on 
the Rights of Women which 
was adopted by the African 
Union in July 2003.

Bartlett, Peter, Blackstone’s 
Guide to the Mental Capacity 
Act 2005, Oxford Univ Press, 
PB, £29.95, 0199289034
The Mental Capacity Act 
2005 comes into force in 

2007 and radically reforms 
the law under which deci-
sions will be made for those 
who lack mental capacity. 
Changes are wide-ranging 
and significant and include: 
a new functional capacity 
test; the primacy of ‘best 
interests’; the creation of a 
new Court of Protection; and 
a new criminal offence of ill-
treatment or wilful neglect. 
This practical guide contains 
a copy of the Act and exam-
ines both the impact of the 
changes introduced and the 
principles and key concepts. 
It is an invaluable resource 
for all practitioners working 
in this complex area. 

Bell, Stuart and McGillivray, 
Donald, Ball & Bell on Envi-
ronmental Law 6ed, Oxford 
Univ Press, PB, £27.99, 
0199260567
The sixth edition of Environ-

mental Law has been totally 
restructured and revised to 
incorporate all the latest 
developments in law since 
2000. The authors’ clear and 
comprehensive writing style 
is supported by learning 
objectives, chapter introduc-
tions, and end of chapter 
summaries, questions and 
web links, making the text 
user friendly and aiding un-
derstanding. Including new 
material on environmental 
crime and re-vamped sectoral 
coverage of the main areas 
of pollution control and na-
ture conservation, the book 
adopts a thematic approach 
to put the law in its policy 
context. Environmental law 
is addressed in relation to 
European and international 
organisations and legislation. 
Subjects will be cross-refer-
enced throughout, allowing 
readers to follow key ideas 
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through the book and to un-
derstand the interaction of 
law and the environment. 
The new text design is attrac-
tive and spacious, featuring 
enhanced pedagogical fea-
tures, and is accompanied by 
a new companion web site 
to provide updates to source 
material and links to other 
useful sites. 

Transfers of Property, Ox-
ford Univ Press, HB, £75.00, 
019927147X
This book provides a detailed 
and up-to-date exposition of 
English and Scottish rules of 
choice of law in inter vivos 
transfers of property. It traces 
the development of the lex 
situs rule, and its applica-
tion to inter vivos dealings 
with immovable property, 
tangible movable property 
(including the special case 

of cultural property), and 
intangible movable property 
(including indirectly held 
securities). The author of-
fers two alternative models 
of suggested choice of law 
rules in property, introducing 
a greater degree of flexibility 
into choice of law rules in 
property, and formulates 
even-handed solutions to the 
complex problems of space, 
time and policy which arise 
in this area of the conflict 
of laws.

Briggs, Adrian and Rees, 
Peter, Civil Jurisdiction and 
Judgements 4ed, Informa 
Publishing, HB, £265.00, 
1843114259

Button, Maurice, Practi-
tioner’s Guide to the FSA 
Listing Rules 2005/06, City 
& Financial, PB, £79.00, 
1905121016

Carruthers, Janeen, Transfer 
of Property in the Conflict 
of Laws: Choice of Law 
Rules Concerning Inter Vivos 

Chalmers, Don, Genetic Test-
ing and the Criminal Law, 
UCL Press, HB, £30.00, 
1844720160
Genetic Testing and the 
Criminal Law is a unique 
international treatment of 
the dynamic and established 
criminal investigation tech-
nique of DNA testing. The 
book gathers together chap-
ters dealing with DNA testing 
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in 12 countries. Each chapter 
deals with the specific crimi-
nal law of the jurisdiction 
in its interaction with the 
expanding use of DNA test-
ing in criminal investigations 
and trials.

Christou, Richard, Boiler-
plate: Practical Clauses 4ed 
(inc CD), Sweet & Maxwell, 
HB, £131.26, 0421898909
This popular and highly prac-
tical guide to the most com-
monly used clauses in com-
mercial contracts presents 
practitioners with an easy-to-
use toolkit for drafting these 
contracts. It sets out the full 
text of a wide range of boil-
erplate clauses and provides 
detailed analytical commen-
tary on each one, together 
with advice on its practical 
application. This new edition 
incorporates the latest case 
law into the clause-by-clause 
discussion.

Leasehold Reform Act 2002 
introduced a new form of 
freehold ownership for both 
residential and commercial 
multi-occupied properties 
such as blocks of flats, office 
blocks and mixed-use devel-
opments. Commonhold is the 
alternative to the traditional 
freehold/leasehold system. 
This book is a succinct and 
authoritative guide to the law 
and practice of commonhold 
provided for by Part I of the 
Act and its supporting rules 
and regulations. 

Charnovitz, Steve et al, Law 
in the Service of Human 
Dignity: Essays in Hon-
our of Florentino Feliciano, 
Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£60.00, 0521852536

Cowan, Gary; Driscoll, James 
and Target, Laurence, Com-
monhold: Law and Practice, 
Law Society , PB, £49.95, 
1853288675
Part I of the Commonhold and 

Dabbah, Maher et al, Merger 
Control Worldwide- 2 vol set, 
Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£395.00, 0521857880
Within the field of competi-
tion law, merger control has 
emerged as a growing area 
of law over the last decade. 
Merger operations can impact 
on a number of jurisdictions, 
and regulatory notification 
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and approval may need to be 
sought in more than one of 
these. This comprehensive, 
multi-contributor collection 
sets out the details of every 
jurisdiction where a mecha-
nism for merger control is in 
place. A concise, practical ac-
count is given of the relevant 
law in each jurisdiction, pre-
sented with the aid of flow-
charts and diagrams. Merger 
Control Worldwide aims to 
provide the legal community, 
in particular law firms and 
policy-makers, with a clear 
point of reference which will 
prove invaluable when mak-
ing decisions and delivering 
sound and accurate advice in 
merger cases. Published in 2 
volumes. 

Douz inas ,  Cos tas  and 
Gearey, Adam, Critical Ju-
risprudence: The Political 
Philosophy of Justice, Hart 
Publishing, PB, £22.00, 
184113452X
This new text is essential 
reading for anyone seeking 
an alternative account of 
the jurisprudential tradition. 
Provocative, engaging and 
insightful, Critical Jurispru-
dence challenges the reader 
to question dominant read-
ings of the law, tracing a 
tradition of critical thought 
that has always haunted the 
orthodoxy. Part text book, 
part user’s manual, the work 
departs from the usual de-
bates that dominate juris-
prudence. Its key thesis is 
that the entire jurisprudential 
tradition needs to be re-as-
sessed. The book offers an 
exploration of the work of 
philosophers and social and 

political theorists whose 
work has not traditionally 
been seen as jurisprudential.

de Burca, Grainne, EU Law 
and the Welfare State: In 
Search of Solidarity, Oxford 
Univ Press, PB, £25.00, 
0199287414

Duxbury, Robert, Telling & 
Duxbury’s Planning Law 
and Procedure 13ed, Oxford 
Univ Press, PB, £26.99, 
0199288046
Telling & Duxbury’s Plan-
ning Law and Procedure is 
a concise and easy-to-read 
guide to the complexities of 
planning law. Covering the 
fundamentals of planning 
law in England and Wales, 
it analyses the key statu-
tory provisions and relevant 
case law. Written in a user-
friendly format to guide the 
reader through this large and 
complex subject, this book 
is ideal for students studying 
courses in law, surveying, 
town planning, architecture 
and environmental law, as 
well as professionals work-
ing in planning. A rigor-
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ous update ensures that the 
book remains abreast of 
the developments heralded 
by the Planning and Com-
pulsory Purchase Act 2004, 
with implications for local 
development, sustainable de-
velopment, the amendments 
to Use Classes Order, and on 
Simplified Planning Zones, 
along with the abolition of 
Crown immunity.

dence that has been relied on 
by courts and advocates in 
many countries to support the 
women’s claims for equality 
and the full enjoyment of 
human rights and funda-
mental freedoms. Growing 
out of a series of judicial 
colloquia organised by the 
Commonwealth Secretariat, 
this compilation brings to-
gether a selection of over 50 
significant cases from inter-
national and national courts, 
in full text or edited format 
and grouped by theme, in 
which courts have used inter-
national human rights norms 
and national constitutional 
standards to contribute to 
women’s equality.

New in 2005, Englemans’ 
Intellectual Property Up-
date provides a consolidated 
overview of the previous 
year’s developments in the 
intellectual property field 
including coverage of copy-
right, trademark and patent 
law. It covers both case law 
and legislation, putting the 
developments into the con-
text of the existing law and 
will publish annually, allow-
ing for regular and frequent 
updating.

Emerton, Robyn et al, In-
ternational Women’s Rights 
Cases ,  Cavendish,  PB, 
£65.00, 1859419062
Using Human rights norms 
to advance the human rights 
of women: a compilation of 
case law. The last two dec-
ades have seen major advanc-
es in the legal protection of 
the human rights of women 
around the world. A series 
of international and national 
court cases has developed an 
important body of jurispru-

Engelman, Mark, Engel-
man’s Intellectual Property 
Update, Tottel, PB, £79.00, 
1845920384, previous ISBN 
0406974128

Equal Opportunities Review, 
EOR Guide to Compensation 
in Discrimination Cases, 
LexisNexisButterworths, 
PB, £95.00, 1405710535
For the first time, the pop-
ular IRS monthly journal 
Equal Opportunities Review 
publishes a guide to the as-
sessment of compensation 
awards in discrimination 
cases. Subscribers to Equal 
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Opportunities Review will 
already be familiar with 
EOR’s annual compensa-
tion awards survey but this 
new publication offers much 
more detailed guidance, with 
summaries of compensation 
awards in over 100 employ-
ment tribunal decisions.

(whether a practitioner text or 
otherwise) which addresses 
this subject-matter in detail. 
Hence the need for this book 
- by a practitioner and for 
practitioners, regardless of 
their specialist area of prac-
tice - on how international 
law is and can be used in the 
domestic courts. The book 
presents in a distilled format 
the relevant principles of 
law, and their application, in 
this area and provide a guide 
to relevant international in-
struments and the way(s) 
in which these instruments 
have been referred to or used 
in English courts. While the 
emphasis is on stating the law 
as it is, the author also identi-
fies the principles which are 
likely to guide practitioners 
in an otherwise unstructured 
area, supported by specific 
examples which will provide 

a subject guide to relevant 
instruments and sources and 
how they can be used.

Fairgrieve, Duncan, Prod-
uct Liability in Compara-
tive Perspective, Cambridge 
Univ Press, HB, £55.00, 
0521847230

Fatima, Shaheed, Using In-
ternational Law in Domestic 
Courts, Hart Publishing, HB, 
£40.00, 1841135151
International law is increas-
ingly referred to and utilised 
in English courts, in fields 
as diverse as criminal pro-
ceedings, children’s rights, 
tort law, and asylum cases. 
Despite this use, there is cur-
rently no book on the market 

Foskett, David et al, Law 
and Practice of Compromise 
6ed, Sweet & Maxwell, HB, 
£180.00, 0421903007
In his foreword to the pre-
vious edition, Lord Woolf 
wrote that “under the Civil 
Procedure Rules, offers to 
settle have become one of the 
most important elements of 
the civil justice system”. The 
Law and Practice of Com-
promise has been especially 
designed to answer all the 
questions raised in this com-
plex area. The book explains 
and provides authoritative 
guidance on compromise 
law, and brings practitioners 
completely up to date with 
the law and practice in this 
area. Given the increasing 
importance of offers to settle 
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as a preferable alternative to 
litigation, the new edition is 
ideally timed. 

Golding, Jon, Tolley’s In-
heritance Tax 2005/06, Lex-
isNexisTolley, PB, £74.95, 
0754528650

gime brought into being by 
the Financial Services and 
Marketing Act 2000, fur-
ther discussion of the Land 
Registration Rules 2003, the 
Countryside and Rights of 
Way Act and the provisions 
of the Commonhold and 
Leasehold Reform Act 2002. 
There is also reference to rel-
evant provisions of the Civil 
Partnership Act 2004, and a 
discussion of the Housing 
Act 2004

Ghose, K., Beyond the Court-
room: A Lawyer’s Guide to 
Campaigning, Legal Ac-
tion Group, PB, £20.00, 
190330735X
This book sets out how law-
yers can go beyond their 
individual cases to influence 
policy, law and practice. It 
challenges lawyers to work 
with each other and in part-
nership with organisations to 
effect social change. Beyond 
the Courtroom is a unique 
new title aimed at lawyers, 
advisers, campaigners, chari-
ties, pressure groups and any-
one who wants to have their 
say in how law and policy 
are made. It brings the ‘cor-
ridors of power’ to life with 
clear and simple explanation 
as well as practical tips and 
case studies. 

Gray, Kevin and Gray, Susan, 
Land Law 4ed (Core Text 
Seies), Oxford Univ Press, 
PB, £16.99, 0199284458
Gray and Gray’s Land Law 
has been updated to include 
coverage of the new regu-
lated mortgage contract re-

Graziadei, Michele; Mat-
tei, Ugo, and Smith, Li-
onel, Commercial Trusts 
in European Private Law, 
Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£85.00, 0521849195
In European legal systems, a 
variety of approaches to trust 
and relationships of trust 
meet the universal profes-
sionalisation of asset man-
agement services. This book 
explores that interface in 
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order to seek a better under-
standing of the legal regula-
tion of the entrustment of 
wealth. Within the methodol-
ogy of the Common Core of 
European Private Law, the 
book sets out cases on the es-
tablishment and termination 
of management relationships, 
obligations of loyalty and 
of professionalism, and the 
choice of law. 

Convention. In an era where 
States are increasingly chal-
lenging the logic of sim-
ply assimilating refugees to 
their own citizens, questions 
are now being raised about 
whether refugees should be 
allowed to enjoy freedom of 
movement, to work, to access 
public welfare programs, or 
to be reunited with family 
members. Doubts have been 
expressed about the propriety 
of exempting refugees from 
visa and other immigration 
rules, and whether there is 
a duty to admit refugees 
at all. Hathaway links the 
standards of the UN Refugee 
Convention to key norms of 
international human rights 
law, and applies his analysis 
to the world’s most diffi-
cult protection challenges. 
This is a critical resource 
for advocates, judges, and 
policymakers. It will also 

be a pioneering scholarly 
work for graduate students 
of international and human 
rights law.

Harvey, Neil et al, Practi-
tioner’s Guide to Takeovers 
and Mergers in the European 
Union 4ed, City & Financial, 
HB, £130.00, 1905121067

Hathaway, James C., Rights 
of Refugees Under Inter-
national Law, Cambridge 
Univ Press, PB, £43.00, 
0521542634
This book presents the first 
comprehensive analysis of 
the human rights of refugees 
as set by the UN Refugee 

Heath, Christopher and Sand-
ers, Anselm Kamperman, 
New Frontiers of Intellectual 
Property Law (ICC Studies 
Vol. 25), Hart Publishing, 
PB, £45.00, 1841135712
This book, arising from the 
collaboration between the 
IEEM in Macao and the Max 
Planck Institute in Munich, 
provides up-to-date informa-
tion on developments in glo-
bal intellectual property law 
and policy and their impact 
on regional economic and 
cultural development.

Jacobs, Edward and Douglas, 
Gillian, Child Support Legis-
lation 7ed 2005/2006, Sweet 
& Maxwell, PB, £77.00, 
0421918608
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The new edition of Child 
Support: The Legislation 
contains the primary and 
secondary legislation relating 
to the child support schemes 
under both the Child Support, 
Pensions and Social Security 
Act 2000 and the Child Sup-
port Act 1995, plus commen-
tary and guidance.

the Founders’ Constitution, 
Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£45.00, 0521852323

Jupp, Kenneth, Rule of Law 
and Other Essays, Shep-
heard-Walwyn, HB, £14.95, 
0856832359
Drawing on his fifteen years’ 
experience as a High Court 
judge in England, the au-
thor explores the concept of 
justice in seven essays. He 
acknowledges that definition 
is far from easy but argues 
that justice today tends to be 
confined within the phrase 
‘social justice’, which is 
inextricably bound up with 
the remedies promoted by 
socialist governments – even 
the policies of ‘right-wing’ 
governments in the West 
are to some extent based on 
socialist principles.

Keane, Adrian, Modern Law 
of Evidence 6ed, Oxford 
Univ Press, PB, £24.95, 
0406975795
The Modern Law of Evi-

Johnson, Calvin H., Right-
eous Anger at the Wicked 
States: The Menacing of 

Jones, Stephen, Criminology 
3ed, Oxford Univ Press, PB, 
£21.99, 0199282382
Criminology provides a thor-
ough, yet succinct, discus-
sion of the distribution and 
causation of crime. Through-
out the text, the author draws 
on a wide range of research 
in order to consider both 
sociological and psychologi-
cal explanations of criminal 
behaviour, aiming to ask the 
right questions rather than 
provide a definitive set of 
answers. In an area of study 
which often presents linguis-
tic difficulties Criminology 
provides the reader with a 
clearly expressed analysis 
of the main criminological 
theories.
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dence is a lucid treatment 
of the contemporary law of 
evidence and is recognised 
as a clear and comprehensive 
account of a complex sub-
ject. This new edition again 
examines the theory of the 
law of evidence as well as 
its practical application, plac-
ing the emphasis, wherever 
possible, on recent discus-
sion and modern aspects of 
the subject. This sixth edi-
tion covers important recent 
changes. In addition to the 
usual common law develop-
ments it also takes account 
of the Criminal Justice Bill 
which will radically alter the 
law relating to character and 
hearsay evidence and will 
have a major impact on the 
subject.

Langbein, John, Origins of 
Adversary Criminal Trial, 
Oxford Univ Press, PB, 

£15.99, 0199287236
The transformation from 
lawyer-free to lawyer-domi-
nated criminal trial happened 
within the space of about a 
century, from the 1690s to the 
1780s. This book explains 
how the lawyers captured 
the trial. In addition to con-
ventional legal sources, Pro-
fessor Langbein draws upon 
a rich vein of contemporary 
pamphlet accounts about tri-
als in London’s Old Bailey. 
The book also mines these 
novel sources to provide 
the first detailed account of 
the formation of the law of 
criminal evidence.

Letwin, Shirley Robin and 
Reynolds, Noel B., On the 
History of the Idea of Law, 
Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£48.00, 0521854237
On the History of the Idea 
of Law is the first book ever 

to trace the development of 
the philosophical theory of 
law from its first appearance 
in Plato’s writings to today. 
Professor Letwin finds im-
portant and positive insights 
and tensions in the theories 
of Plato, Aristotle, Augus-
tine, and Hobbes. She finds 
confusions and serious errors 
introduced by Cicero, Aqui-
nas, Bentham, and Marx. 
She harnesses the insights 
of H. L. A. Hart and espe-
cially Michael Oakeshott to 
mount a devastating attack 
on the late twentieth-century 
theories of Ronald Dworkin, 
the Critical Legal Studies 
movement, and feminist 
jurisprudence.

Lewis, Tamara, Employment 
Law: An Adviser’s Handbook 
6ed, Legal Action Group, PB, 
£28.00, 1903307368
Since publication of the first 
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edition in 1991, this book has 
become a key employment 
law text. Law, tactics, prac-
tice, evidence and tribunal 
procedure are examined in 
detail. It is uniquely focused 
on the employee. The book 
examines the cornerstones 
of employment law - wages; 
unfair dismissal; redundancy 
and TUPE; equality and dis-
crimination and procedure. 
The sixth edition has been 
revised and expanded. 

Lowry, John and Dignam, 
Alan, Company Law Core 
Text 3ed, John Lowry; Alan 
Dignam, Oxford Univ Press, 
PB, £16.99, 0199284466
This highly accessible text-
book offers an overview of 
company law, covering a 
typical undergraduate com-
pany law syllabus. It enables 
students to see the area in its 
full context, by discussing 

the current debates surround-
ing company law. Particular 
emphasis is given to cor-
porate governance and the 
theoretical bases underlying 
company law.

after the widely acclaimed 
first edition, builds on the 
reputation of the first edition 
by offering a detailed ex-
amination of the developing 
law of insurance, combining 
exposition of the law with 
critical analysis. This new 
edition has been substantially 
restructured to complement 
the authors’ Insurance Law: 
Cases and Materials (Hart 
Publishing, 2004).

Lowry, John and Rawlings, 
Philip, Insurance Law: Doc-
trine and Principles 2ed, 
Hart Publishing, PB, £25.00, 
1841135402
The second edition of Insur-
ance Law: Doctrines and 
Principles published six years 

Macdonald, Ian and Web-
ber, Frances, Macdonald’s 
Immigration Law and Prac-
tice 6ed, LexisNexisBut-
terworths, HB, £166.00, 
0406969728
Since the publication of the 
first edition in 1983 Mac-
donald’s Immigration Law & 
Practice has established itself 
as the standard textbook in 
the field and is recognised 
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by the legal profession as the 
most authoritative text on im-
migration law. Written with 
precision by leading immi-
gration experts the work has 
been updated to offer all of 
the latest legislation, cases, 
political developments and 
commentary and guidance 
on every significant aspect of 
the law and practice of immi-
gration. The sixth edition has 
been fully revised to include 
the provisions of the Asylum 
and Immigration (Treatment 
of Claimants) Act 2004 and 
will also include the 2005 im-
migration appeals procedure 
rules. The book also contains 
the latest SIs and the 2004 
Immigration Directorate and 
Asylum Policy Instructions. 

Mallender, Paul and Ray-
son, Jane, Civil Partnership 
Act 2004: Practical Guide, 
Cambridge Univ Press, PB, 
£45.00, 0521617928
This authoritative guide to 
the Civil Partnership Act 
2004 is written by Paul Mal-
lender and Jane Rayson, two 
family law barristers with a 
combined practice experi-
ence of over fifty years. “The 
Civil Partnership Act 2004: 
A Practical Guide” provides 
clear, concise explanations 
of the new legislation. This 
book covers the lifetime of 
a relationship, from entering 
into the civil partnership, its 
consequences in terms of 
financial and family arrange-
ments, to practical guidance 
on how the partnership is dis-
solved and the consequences 
of breakdown and death. 

Maslen, Stuart, Commentar-

ies on Arms Control Trea-
ties Volume I 2ed, Oxford 
Univ Press, PB, £35.00, 
0199287023
In this book an overview 
of the principles of treaty 
interpretation is provided 
for non-specialists, and ex-
tensive source material, in-
cluding the various drafts of 
the Convention, are included 
as appendixes. This second 
edition comprehensively 
updates the analysis of the 
Convention, and extends the 
source material to include 
the UN General Assembly 
Resolutions 58/53 and 59/84, 
and the Final report of the 
First review Conference of 
the State Parties to the Con-
vention. 

Maughan, Caroline and 
Webb, Julian, Lawyering 
Skills and the Legal Process 
2ed, Cambridge Univ Press, 

Macintosh, Kerry Lynn, Il-
legal Beings: Human Clones 
and the Law, Cambridge 
Univ Press, HB, £16.99, 
0521853281
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PB, £24.99, 0521619505
Lawyering Skills and the 
Legal Process bridges the 
gap between academic and 
practical law for students 
undertaking skills-based 
and clinical legal education 
courses at university. It de-
velops oral and written com-
munication, group working, 
problem solving and conflict 
resolution skills in a range of 
legal contexts: client inter-
viewing, drafting, managing 
cases, legal negotiation and 
advocacy.

Moffat, Graham, Trusts Law: 
Text and Materials 4ed, 
Cambridge Univ Press, PB, 
£35.00, 0521674662
With its unique contextual 
emphasis and authoritative 
commentary, this is a book 
that no serious undergraduate 
on trust law courses can af-
ford to be without. The book 

is divided into four main 
parts: trusts and the preserva-
tion of family wealth; trusts 
and family breakdown; trusts 
and commerce; and trusts 
and non-profit activity.

tablished text updates the 
previous edition following 
significant changes in Trade 
Mark law and procedure.

Morcom, Christopher et 
al, Modern Law of Trade 
Marks 2ed, LexisNexisBut-
terworths, HB, £239.00, 
0406958599
The new edition of this es-

Morris, Glynis, UK Ac-
counting Practice, Lexis-
NexisTolley, HB, £85.00, 
0754528014

Murphy, Peter and Stockdale, 
Eric, Blackstone’s Crimi-
nal Practice 2006, Oxford 
Univ Press, HB, £155.00, 
0199287694, Book + CD Set, 
£185.00, 0199287716
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Blackstone’s Criminal Prac-
tice 2006 provides a single, 
well-referenced, and afford-
able volume of all the mate-
rial that is truly essential 
to criminal practice in the 
magistrates’ court and in the 
Crown Court. Expert com-
mentary of uncompromis-
ing quality has ensured the 
book’s position as a leading 
reference for the criminal 
practitioner.

Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£50.00, 0521854016
European constitutionalism is 
not merely an intra-European 
phenomenon but it can also 
be compared to other major 
forms of constitutionalism. 
Over the past decade or so 
issues have emerged which 
seem to indicate that Euro-
pean constitutional theory 
and practice is becoming 
aware that it has developed 
certain rules and possesses 

certain characteristics which 
distinguish it from US consti-
tutionalism and vice versa. 

Nelson-Jones, Rodney, But-
terworths Personal Injury 
Damages Statistics 2005, 
LexisNexisButterworths, 
PB, £35.00, 1405710128

Nexia International, Tottel’s 
International Handbook of 
Corporate and Personal 
Taxes, Tottel, PB, £85.00, 
1845921720

Nolte, Georg, European 
and US Constitutionalism, 

Owen, Tim et al, Blackstone’s 
Guide to the Serious Organ-
ised Crime and Police Act 
2005, Oxford Univ Press, 
PB, £29.95, 0199289069
Written by a team of expert 
practitioners in the area, this 
Guide comprehensively ex-
plains the scope and impact 
of the Act and highlights the 
radical changes to the law 
it makes including the civil 
liberties and human rights 
implications. It is structured 
in a clear and logical way, 
following the structure of the 
Act itself, and also contains a 
full copy of the Act. 

Padfield, Nicola, Archbold: 
Magistrates Court Crimi-
nal Practice 2005, Sweet 
& Maxwell, HB, £175.00, 
0421905700
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Following the style and ap-
proach of Archbold for the 
Crown Court, with expert 
and detailed coverage of both 
substantive law and court 
procedure, this book pro-
vides a ‘one-stop shop’ for 
magistrates’ courts criminal 
work. The new second edi-
tion builds on the success of 
the first to provide compre-
hensive, accessible guidance 
for the criminal practitioner.

Paulsson, Jan, Denial of 
International Justice, Cam-
bridge Univ Press, HB, 
£50.00, 0521851181
Denial of justice is one of 
the oldest bases of liability 
in international law and the 
modern understanding of 
denial of justice is examined 
by Paulsson in this book. 
The possibilities for pros-
ecuting the offence of denial 
of justice have evolved in 
fundamental ways and it is 
now settled law that States 
cannot disavow international 
responsibility by arguing that 
their courts are independent 
of the government. Even 
more importantly, the doors 
of international tribunals 
have swung wide open to 
admit claimants other than 
states: non-governmental 
organisations, corporations, 
and individuals, and Pauls-
son examines several recent 
cases of great importance in 
his book.

Pettit, Philip, Equity and the 
Law of Trusts 10ed, Oxford 
Univ Press, PB, £31.99, 
0199285349
Equity and the Law of Trusts 
is a long-established work 
providing students with com-
prehensive coverage of all 
topics relevant to undergrad-
uate studies . The author’s 

concise writing style pro-
vides the reader with a clear 
understanding of the issues 
surrounding equity and trusts 
law. The tenth edition it has 
been fully revised and up-
dated to include new material 
on resulting and constructive 
trusts, and proprietary estop-
pel, as well as new legislation 
relating to limitations and 
perpetuities. 

Potts, Julia, VAT in Property 
and Construction (Case in 
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Point), RICS Books, PB, 
£19.95, 1842192299
This reference book provides 
you with guidance on VAT in 
the property and construction 
industry. Focusing on all 
the key case decisions, this 
practical and concise book 
will be invaluable to under-
stand when and where VAT 
applicable and is an ideal 
first point of reference for 
the non-specialist. Based on 
summaries of VAT cases this 
guide covers: the legislation; 
the operation of VAT; the 
concept of a VAT ‘supply ‘; 
compliance property trans-
actions; option to tax; sales 
and letting of residential 
property; ‘relevant ‘residen-
tial and charitable purpose 
buildings; and urban regen-
eration and energy efficient 
construction. 

Theory of Enforcement , 
Cambridge Univ Press, HB, 
£45.00, 0521846692
This book is the first compre-
hensive study of the meaning 
and measure of enforceability. 
While we have long debated 
what restraints should govern 
the conduct of our social life, 
we have paid relatively little 
attention to the question of 
what it means to make a re-
straint enforceable. Focusing 
on the enforceability of legal 
rights but also addressing the 
enforceability of moral rights 
and social conventions, Mark 
Reiff explains how we use 
punishment and compensa-
tion to make restraints opera-
tive in the world. 

subject of financial assistance 
for the acquisition of shares, 
in which the authors give a 
detailed analysis of the cur-
rent legislation and a critical 
review of the relevant case 
law. Financial assistance is a 
complex, technical and high-
ly regulated aspect of com-
pany law, and mistakes have 
serious civil consequences 
and criminal sanctions. This 
book assists practitioners 
with the interpretation of 
this difficult area of law and 
allows them to advise with 
confidence.

MAJOR NEW TITLES THIS MONTH – Continued

Reiff, Mark, Punishment, 
Compensation, and Law: 

Roberts, Catherine and Ho-
ran, Stephen, Financial As-
sistance for the Acquisition of 
Shares, Oxford Univ Press, 
HB, £115.00, 0199285691
This is a practical guide to the 

Roberts, Simon and Palmer, 
Michael, Dispute Process-
es: ADR and the Primary 
Forms of Decision-Making, 
Cambridge Univ Press, PB, 
£27.99, 0521676010
This wide-ranging study con-
siders the primary forms of 
alternative dispute resolution 
(ADR) - negotiation, media-
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tion, and umpiring - in the 
context of the rapidly chang-
ing discourses and practices 
of civil justice that are taking 
place across a broad range 
of jurisdictions. Potential 
litigants increasingly need 
to be aware of the whole 
range of dispute manage-
ment processes available to 
them, and lawyers have to 
develop skills beyond those 
traditionally associated with 
litigation and the courts. 
This new edition brings to-
gether and analyses a wide 
range of materials dealing 
with dispute processes and 
the current debates on civil 
justice. With the help of a 
selection of texts beyond 
those ordinarily found in the 
emerging alternative dispute 
resolution literature it pro-
vides a broad, comparative 
perspective on modes of han-
dling civil disputes, with the 
principal focus on the central 
processes of negotiation and 
mediation. 

Robertson, Lindsay, Conquest 
by Law, Oxford Univ Press, 
HB, £17.99, 019514869X
This is a gripping tale of 
political collision, detailing 
how a spurious claim gave 
rise to a doctrine – intended 
to be of limited application 
– which itself gave rise to 

a massive displacement of 
persons and the creation of a 
law that governs indigenous 
people and their lands to 
this day.

munications regulation and 
law in over 20 European 
countries. It offers the reader 
expert advice on the potential 
opportunities as well as legal 
consequences or pitfalls in 
the conduct and expansion 
of the telecoms business in 
Europe.

Shah, Prakash, Legal Plu-
ralism in Conflict: Coping 
with Cultural Diversity in 
Law, Glasshouse Press, HB, 
£35.00, 1904385583
Legal Pluralism in Conflict 
is the result of the author’s 
experience as a teacher and 
researcher in the field of 
ethnic minorities and the 
law. The book begins by 
developing a legal pluralist 
theoretical framework to ana-
lyse the interaction of ethnic 
minority laws and British 
laws, before examining the 
limits of existing approaches 
to legal education and chart-
ing the development of the 
alternative course of ethnic 
minorities legal studies.

Silverman, Frances, Law So-
ciety’s Conveyancing Hand-
book 12ed, Law Society , 
HB, £79.95, 1853289280
The Conveyancing Hand-
book is designed to provide 
busy practitioners with the 
resources to tackle everyday 

MAJOR NEW TITLES THIS MONTH – Continued

Scherer, Joachim, Telecom-
munications Law in Europe 
5ed, Tottel, PB, £195.00, 
1845920783, previous ISBN 
0406964041
This new edition provides a 
comprehensive and up-to-
date overview of telecom-
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questions and to understand 
the impact of new develop-
ments. It continues to be the 
most reliable, accurate and 
up-to-date source of infor-
mation and guidance on all 
aspects of conveyancing 
practice. 

Statesman’s Yearbook 2006, 
142ed, Palgrave Macmillan, 
HB, £95.00, 1403914826

PB, £49.95, 1853289450
A ‘good practice’ guide for 
all those involved in the 
administration of trusts, this 
book puts trusts law into 
practice in a readable style 
with checklists, worked ex-
amples and precedents. 

MAJOR NEW TITLES THIS MONTH – Continued

Steele, Gill, Trust Practition-
er’s Handbook, Law Society , 

Susskind, Richard, Susskind 
Interviews: Legal Experts 
in Changing Times, Sweet 
& Maxwell, HB, £65.00, 
042191260X
This book comprises a se-
ries of interviews with lead-
ing figures in the UK legal 
world conducted by Richard 
Susskind OBE, Gresham 
Professor of Law. The in-
terviews took place over the 
last three years and provide 
an unprecedented snapshot 
of this turbulent period in 
the development of the legal 
system.

Thomas, E. W., Judicial 

Process: Realism, Pragma-
tism, Practical Reasoning 
and Principles, Cambridge 
Univ Press, HB, £55.00, 
0521855667
This book seeks to bridge 
the gap between legal theory 
and judicial practice. The 
author propounds a coherent 
and comprehensive judicial 
methodology for modern 
times. Founded on the truism 
that the law exists to serve 
society, and adopting the 
twin criteria of justice and 
contemporaneity with the 
times, a judicial methodol-
ogy is developed which is 
realistic and pragmatic and 
which embraces a revised 
conception of practical rea-
soning, including in that 
conception a critical role for 
legal principles.

Tiley, John, Revenue Law 
5ed, Hart Publishing, PB, 



OCT/NOV 2005  ��

MAJOR NEW TITLES THIS MONTH – Continued

£45.00, 1841135364
This is the 5th edition of John 
Tileys major text on revenue 
law. Following a familiar 
pattern it has been exten-
sively revised to incorporate 
changes wrought by succes-
sive Finance Acts as well as 
the Inland Revenue’s tax law 
rewrite. The basic structure 
remains the same. The book 
is designed for law students 
taking the subject in the 
final year of their law degree 
course or for more advanced 
courses and is intended to be 
of interest to all who enjoy 
tax law. 

Treitel, Sir Guenter and 
Rose, Prof Francis, Carver 
on Bills of Lading 2ed, Sweet 
& Maxwell, HB, £255.00, 
0421877006
Supplies definitive guidance 
on the law relating to bills 
of lading.

Trybus, Martin, Europeam 
Union Law and Defence 
Integration, Hart Publishing, 
HB, £50.00, 1841134406

Vaines, Peter, Revenue Law- 
Principles and Practice 
23ed, Tottel, PB, £64.95, 
1845921968
This long established and 
popular annual title remains 
an indispensable guide to 
every practitioner and stu-

dent of taxation. The new 
edition is revised and up-
dated throughout to take 
account of recent cases and 
the 2005 Finance Act. It sets 
out the basic principles of 
revenue law in a clear and 
concise format, detailing the 
practical application of the 
tax system in simple, non-
technical language.

Wagner, Anne et al, Contem-
porary Issues of the Semiot-
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ics of Law, Hart Publishing, 
PB, £22.00, 1841135461

Wallace, Rebecca M M, In-
ternational Law 5ed, Sweet 
& Maxwell, PB, £23.95, 
042188410X
A Key text for both law stu-
dents and non-law students 
following courses in subject 
areas such as International 
Politics, International Rela-
tions and Human Rights.

Wareham, Robert et al, Tol-
ley’s Tax Data 2005-06- 
Finance Act Edition, Lex-
isNexisTolley, PB, £42.00, 
0754528693

Wellman, Christopher Heath 

and Simmons, A. John, Is 
There a Duty to Obey the 
Law, Cambridge Univ Press, 
PB, £12.99, 0521537843
The central question in po-
litical philosophy is whether 
political states have the right 
to coerce their constituents 
and whether citizens have 
a moral duty to obey the 
commands of their state. 
Christopher Heath Wellman 
and A. John Simmons defend 
opposing answers to this 
question.

Whittaker, Simon, Liability 
for Products: English Law, 
French Law. And Europe-
an Harmonization, Oxford 
Univ Press, HB, £80.00, 
0198256132
This comparative study con-
siders the French and English 
laws governing all those who 
may be liable for products: 
their producers, their sup-

pliers, their users and their 
regulators. To do so, it ex-
amines in each system the 
private law of tort and con-
tract and aspects of the civil 
process which are important 
in determining liability; the 
administrative law concern-
ing failures to regulate or 
control product safety; and 
the liability for products of 
suppliers of public services, 
such as water or healthcare. 

Wild, Charles et al, Internet 
Law, Old Bailey Press, PB, 
£15.95, 1858365732
This new text offers, for the 
first time, a complete review 
of the area of Internet law. 
The discussion commences 
with an analysis of e-con-
tracts, ranging from details 
of their formation, on-line 
terms/conditions through to 
a consideration of associated 
jurisdictional and choice of 
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law issues. In addition, e-fi-
nance is considered, focusing 
on the use and regulation of 
credit cards on the Internet 
together with an evaluation 
of other methods of payment, 
including Smart Cards and 
electronic money.

Williams, Andrew, EU Hu-
man Rights Policies: Study 
In Irony, Oxford Univ Press, 
PB, £19.99, 0199291497
Internally, within the EU, 
human rights are contingent. 
Scrutiny is erratic and even 
casual, and enforcement is 
left to the courts and inde-
pendent agencies. Externally, 
in the EU’s interactions with 
non-members, however, the 
story is very different: human 
rights are broad in concept. 
Collective notions of rights 
are accepted and promoted. 
Scrutiny can be intrusive 
and effective, and systems 
of enforcement, increas-

ingly severe in scope and 
strength, have been applied. 
This book examines the na-
ture and scope of the bifurca-
tion and explains its origins 
and development. In doing 
so it questions orthodox 
interpretations and provides 
a radical new reading of the 
EU’s human rights law and 
practice. At its heart, the 
book claims that without a 
fundamental reappraisal of 
the basis upon which the EU 
responds to human rights, it 
will remain plagued by this 
ironical condition.

Wilman, John, Brown: GCSE 
Law 9ed, Sweet & Maxwell, 
PB, £13.95, 0421897902

Zamora, Stephen et al, Mexi-
can Law, Oxford Univ Press, 
PB, £35.00, 0199288488
This book provides an over-
view of the Mexican legal 

system. It sets forth the basic 
rules and legal doctrines, 
surveys the key institutions 
that make and enforce the 
law in Mexico, and places 
them in their cultural context. 
It makes frequent compari-
sons to United States legal 
doctrines and institutions, 
and provides a foundation 
for understanding the role of 
law and legal institutions in 
shaping public and private 
life in Mexico.



�� WILDY’S BOOK NEWS        

Comprehensive •  Access ible •  Supplemented • Portable •  Authoritat ive

Making sense
of it all...

NEW

2006 EDITION 

OUT NOW
!

Front cover  7/10/05  5:33 pm  Page 1



OCT/NOV 2005  ��

Comprehensive •  Access ible •  Supplemented • Portable •  Authoritat ive

Making sense
of it all...

NEW

2006 EDITION 

OUT NOW
!

Front cover  7/10/05  5:33 pm  Page 1

NEW

Practice Volum
eYou’ll be the one 

with the advantage...

� Gives authoritative guidance on every aspect
of PI law, practice and procedure

� Covers all kinds of cases from fatal accidents
to industrial accidents, group actions to
clinical negligence

� Focuses on strategies and tactics 

� Helps you take on even unfamiliar
and complex cases with confidence 

� Offers a balanced perspective between
claimant and defendant viewpoints

� Written by a team of leading barristers and
solicitors under General Editor Andrew Ritchie

� Excellent value at £175 (or £125 if you subscribe
to Kemp & Kemp: The Quantum of Damages)

Publication date: November 2005, ISBN 0 421 90510 7

...because
PI practice isn't 

black and white

...with the new
Kemp & Kemp 

Personal Injury Law,
Practice and Procedure

S&M 759 Counsel A5 Ad K&K  4/10/05  09:04  Page 1





OCT/NOV 2005  ��

SUBSCRIPTIONS & SUPPLEMENTS
PUBLISHED IN OCTOBER

ADMINISTRATION OF ESTATES ISSUE 19 £83.50
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS COMMERCIAL CASES PART 7 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS COMMERCIAL CASES PART 8 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS EUROPEAN CASES PART 9 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS OCTOBER 2005 CD-ROM £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS VOLUME 3 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS VOLUME 4 PART 1 & SUPPLEMENT 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS VOLUME 4 PART 2 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS VOLUME 4 PART 3 2005 £0.00
ALL ENGLAND LAW REPORTS VOLUME 4 PART 4 2005 £0.00
AMERICAN INTERNATIONAL LAW CASES 2004 NUMBER 3 £77.90
AMERICAN INTERNATIONAL LAW CASES 2004 NUMBER 4 £77.90
ATKINS COURT FORMS SERVICE ISSUE 23 2005 £0.00
ATKIN’S COURT FORMS VOLUME 35 2005 £189.00
ATKINS COURT FORMS VOLUME 6 PART 1 2005 £189.00
BERNSTEIN HANDBOOK RENT REVIEW RELEASE 42 £130.00
BEST VALUE MANUAL BULLETIN NUMBER 20 £0.00
BUTTERWORTHS COMPANY LAW CASES VOLUME 2 PART 2 2005 £0.00
BUTTERWORTHS FAMILY LAW SERVICE ISSUE 129 £189.00
BUTTERWORTHS FINANCIAL REGULATION SERVICE ISSUE 22 £179.00
BUTTERWORTHS FINANCIAL REGULATIONS SERVICE VOLUME 6 ISSUE 22 £69.00
BUTTERWORTHS HUMAN RIGHTS CASES PART 5 2005 £0.00
BUTTERWORTHS IMMIGRATION LAW SERVICE ISSUE 51 £109.00
BUTTERWORTHS LAW OF EDUCATION ISSUE 79 £220.50
BUTTERWORTHS LOCAL GOVERNMENT REPORTS PART 8 2005 £0.00
BUTTERWORTHS OFFSHORE TAX ISSUE 84 £115.00
BUTTERWORTHS PROPERTY LAW SERVICE ISSUE 49 £125.00
BUTTERWORTHS ROAD TRAFFIC LAW ISSUE 48 £139.00
CANADIAN CRIMINAL CASES VOLUME 198 £118.75
CHARITIES ADMINISTRATION UPDATE 11 PLUS CD-ROM £75.00
CHARITIES ADMINISTRATION UPDATE 11 PLUS CD-ROM £75.00
CLAIMS TO THE POSSESSION OF LAND ISSUE 12 £96.50
CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRY LAW NEWSLETTER OCTOBER 2005 £0.00
CURRENT LAW MONTHLY DIGEST SEPTEMBER 2005 £0.00
DOMINION LAW REPORTS BOUND VOLUME 255 £118.75
EC MERGER CONTROL REPORTER SUPPLEMENT 110 £210.00
EC MERGER CONTROL REPORTER SUPPLEMENT 111 £110.00
EC MERGER CONTROL REPORTER SUPPLEMENT 112 £206.00
EMPLOYMENT LAW IN ONTARIO ISSUE 12 £66.50
EMPLOYMENT TAX PLANNING ISSUE 39 £82.00
ENCY FORMS AND PRECEDENTS CONSOLIDATED TABLES 2005 £245.00
ENCY FORMS AND PRECEDENTS VOLUME 11 2005 £245.00
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ENCY FORMS AND PRECEDENTS VOLUME 17 PART 2 2005 £245.00
ENCYCLOPAEDIA OF BANKING LAW ISSUE 94 £206.00
ENCYCLOPEDIA OF ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH RELEASE 111 £0.00
ENCYCLOPEDIA OF ROAD TRAFFIC LAW RELEASE 136 £0.00
ENTERTAINMENT & MEDIA LAW REPORTS SEPT-OCTOBER 2005 £0.00
ENVIRONMENTAL LAW BULLETIN NUMBER 117 2005 £0.00
ENVIRONMENTAL LAW PROCEDURES MANAGEMENT ISSUE 21 £71.94
EUROPEAN CURRENT LAW MONTHLY DIGEST SEPTEMBER 2005 £0.00
EUROPEAN HUMAN RIGHTS REPORTS PART 4 2005 £0.00
EUROPEAN PHARMACOPIA SUPPLEMENT 5.4 £82.00
FINANCE LAW OLDER CLIENT ISSUE 20 £79.50
FLEET STREET REPORTS PART 11 2005 £0.00
GARNERS ENVIRONMENTAL LAW BULLETIN NUMBER 86 2005 £0.00
HALSBURY’S LAWS OF ENGLAND SERVICE ISSUE 387 2005 £0.00
HALSBURY’S LAWS OF ENGLAND SERVICE ISSUE 388 2005 £0.00
HALSBURY’S LAWS OF ENGLAND VOLUME 55 2005 £275.00
HALSBURY’S LAWS OF ENGLAND VOLUME 56 2005 £275.00
HALSBURY’S STATUTES VOLUME 12 PART 1 2005 £226.00
HALSBURY’S STATUTES VOLUME 12 PART 2 2005 £226.00
HALSBURY’S STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS ISSUE 395 2005 £0.00
HALSBURY’S STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS VOLUME 18 2005 £140.00
HILL & REDMAN LANDLORD AND TENANT ISSUE 51 £156.00
HONG KONG CIVIL COURT PRACTICE VOLUME 1 ISSUE 29 £108.00
HONG KONG CIVIL COURT PRACTICE VOLUME 2 ISSUE 17 £99.00
INDIVIDUAL VOLUNTARY ARRANGEMENTS UPDATE 10 PLUS CD-ROM £90.00
INDUSTRIAL RELATIONS LAW REPORTS VOLUME 34 NUMBER 10 2005 £0.00
INHERITANCE ACT CLAIMS UPDATE 4 PLUS CD-ROM £80.00
INSURANCE AND REINSURANCE LAW BRIEFING ISSUE 107 2005 £0.00
INTERNATIONAL LAW REPORTS VOL127 £110.00
INTERNATIONAL REGULATION OF FINANCE & INVESTMENT 2005-05 £130.00
JOURNAL PLANNING AND ENVIRONMENTAL LAW OCTOBER 2005 £0.00
JUTA’S INDEX & ANNOTATIONS TO SOUTH AFRICAN LAW REPORTS 2004 £0.00
LEGAL ACTION MAGAZINE OCTOBER 2005 £0.00
MARTINS CRIMINAL CODE COUNSEL EDITION RELEASE 64 £102.60
MELLOWS TAXATION OF EXECUTORS AND TRUSTEES ISSUE 20 £72.00
MERKIN ARBITRATION LAW ISSUE 41 £0.00
NEW DIRECTIONS LAW OF THE SEA 2005-1 £128.25
PROPERTY PLANNING COMPENSATION REPORTS PART 3 2005 £0.00
RAYDEN AND JACKSON ON DIVORCE 18TH EDITION ISSUE 2 £170.00
SHAWCROSS AND BEAUMONT AIR LAW ISSUE 101 £245.00
SIMON’S NATIONAL INSURANCE CONTRIBUTIONS ISSUE 46 £100.70
SUMPTION CAPITAL GAINS TAX ISSUE 82 £99.00
TAXATION MAGAZINE VOLUME 155 NUMBER 4027 £0.00
TAXATION MAGAZINE VOLUME 155 NUMBER 4028 £0.00
TAXATION MAGAZINE VOLUME 156 NUMBER 4029 £0.00
TAXATION MAGAZINE VOLUME 156 NUMBER 4030 £0.00



OCT/NOV 2005  ��

TAXATION OF LOAN RELATIONSHIPS AND DERIVATIVES ISSUE 12 £95.00
THE DIGEST CONSOLIDATED TABLE OF CASES H-P 2005 £199.00
THE INDUSTRIAL CASES REPORTS PART 10 2005 £0.00
THE LAW REPORTS PARTS 9 AND 10 2005 £0.00
THE LAW REPORTS STATUTES PART 5 2005 £0.00
TIMES LAW REPORTS PART 17 2005 £0.00
TOLLEY’S COMPANY LAW & INSOLVENCY SEPTEMBER 2005 £0.00
TOLLEY’S MANUAL OF ACCOUNTING ISSUE 30 £75.00
TOLLEY’S PENSION LAW ISSUE 31 £68.40
VICTORIA LAW REPORTS CUMULATIVE SUPPLEMENT VOLUME 9 £81.00
VICTORIA LAW REPORTS VOLUME 10 PARTS AND BOUND VOLUME £130.50
WEEKLY LAW REPORTS PART 34 2005 £0.00
WEEKLY LAW REPORTS PART 35 2005 £0.00
WEEKLY LAW REPORTS PART 36 2005 £0.00
WEEKLY LAW REPORTS PART 37 2005 £0.00
WILLIAMS HANDBOOK OF BUSINESS TENANCIES RELEASE 30 £125.00
WILLIAMS HANDBOOK OF DILAPIDATIONS RELEASE 25 £125.00
WILLOUGHBY HONG KONG TAXATION ISSUE 12 TO VOLUME 1 £100.00

Items marked as £0.00 are part of an annual subscription and
therefore no part price applies

His Excellency Laleshwar K. N. Singh CCH, Guyana High Commissioner with 
John Pethick at the Guyana Law Association Fund Raising Dinner & Dance.
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Not ANOTHER Charity Cycle Ride! - South Africa �00�

Last year many readers and publishers sponsored my Charity Cycle Ride around 
Cuba in aid of the Zurich Foundation’s Kids 2 Care 4 charity. Thanks to their gen-
erosity I managed to raise just over £7,000.

Well I am off again this month. This time I will be cycling in South Africa.

Once again I would like to thank all the kind readers and publishers who have 
sponsored me.

John Sinkins

www.tottelpublishing.com 

are delighted to sponsor

John Sinkins on his 

Kids 2 Care 4 cycle tour

are delighted to sponsor

John Sinkins on his 

Kids 2 Care 4 cycle tour

of South Africaof South Africa
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John Sinkins on his

KIDS2 CARE 4
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South Africa

For all the latest releases go to
www.informalaw.com and order
your copies at Wildy & Sons Ltd.

For all the latest releases go to
www.informalaw.com and order
your copies at Wildy & Sons Ltd.
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Jordan Publishing wish John good
luck on his Kids 2 Care 4 charity

cycle tour of South Africa

A U T H O R I T Y ,   V A L U E  A N D  S E R V I C E  S I N C E  1 8 6 3
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IMPORTANT  FORTHCOMING  PUBLICATIONS

Privilege, �nd edition
by Colin Passmore, XPL 
Publishing, Hardback, ISBN 
1-85811-361-X, due Decem-
ber 2005, c £125.00
The scope of the two main 
heads of privilege have only 
recently been settled by the 
Courts, notwithstanding that 
privilege can be traced back 
many hundreds of years. 
With the Three Rivers case, 
the position is now clearer 
as the author describes in 
the new edition of this, the 
leading work on the subject 
which examines privilege in 
all its aspects in terms which 
will appeal to the practitioner 
and academic alike.  The new 
edition comprehensively 
covers such areas as advice 
privilege, litigation privilege, 
and sharing privilege, as 
well as issues such as pre-
existing documents, joint 
and common interests and 
losing privilege.  Extensive 
coverage is also given to 
the position of agents and 
third parties, the crime-fraud 
exception, and issues sur-
rounding claiming privi-
lege and waiving privilege. 
The author’s explanation of 
the subject is both detailed 
and analytical, providing 
the reader with a definitive, 
comprehensive and expertly 
written account. Colin Pass-
more is head of  litigation 
at Simmons & Simmons, 
the international law firm. 
He qualified as a solicitor in 
1984 initially specialising 

in shipping litigation before 
undertaking a broader litiga-
tion practice when he went 
to work for Simmons & 
Simmons in its Hong Kong 
office from 1986 to 1991. 
Since returning to London he 
has developed a commercial 
litigation practice with an 
emphasis on professional 
negligence, banking and 
insolvency litigation. 

The  Executive  and  Public 
Law: Power and Account-
ability  in  Comparative 
Perspective
Edited by Paul Craig and 
Adam Tomkins, Oxford Uni-
versity Press, Hardback, 
ISBN 0-19-928559-4, Due 
November 2005, c. £50.00
For most of the past two 
hundred years or more - the 
grand era of national con-
stitution-making - founding 
fathers and constitutional 
scholars alike seem to have 
focused more sharply on 
questions of legislative power 
than they have on executive 
power. Executive power, by 
contrast, they worried much 
less about and sought to 
delimit less thoroughly. The 
scope of executive power 
and its accountability are 
however endemic problems, 
which arise within federal 
and non-federal states. Nor 
are these issues unique to 
common law constitutional 
orders. Problems concerning 
the nature and delimitation of 
executive power also arise 

in civil law jurisdictions 
and in the European Union. 
Despite the historical consti-
tutional focus on legislative 
power, it is executive author-
ity which seems in the early 
21st-century to be the more 
threatening, especially in the 
wake of the Iraq war, and the 
Guantanamo Bay detainees. 
This book addresses two sets 
of questions that are under-
researched in constitutional 
scholarship. What is the 
proper scope of executive 
authority, how is executive 
power delimited, and how 
should it be defined? How is 
executive authority best held 
to account, politically and 
legally? These questions are 
both descriptive and norma-
tive and they are addressed 
accordingly in each of the 
chapters by leading public 
lawyers from a variety of ju-
risdictions. The book exam-
ines executive power in the 
United Kingdom from a Brit-
ish and from a distinctively 
Scottish perspective. There 
are chapters on the four com-
mon law jurisdictions of Aus-
tralia, New Zealand, Canada, 
and the United States; on the 
four civil law jurisdictions of 
France, Germany, Italy, and 
Spain; and on the European 
Union. This insightful com-
parative perspective allows 
themes to be drawn together, 
and lessons extracted on the 
nature of executive power 
and its accountability. 
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Property  Transactions: 
Stamp Duty Land Tax
b y  J a n e  D o u g l a s  a n d 
Katharine Fenn, Sweet & 
Maxwell ,  ISBN 0-421-
90310-4, due November 
2005, c.£79.00
This is a short, sharp, practi-
cal guide to the new Stamp 
Duty Land Tax, to help con-
veyancers understand the 
new procedures and be aware 
of traps and pitfalls. The 
guide aims to clarify the law, 
the procedures and the prob-
lem areas in a down to earth 
and easily readable manner. 
It provides invaluable help 
to complete the forms, in-
cluding plenty of completed 
examples.  The book covers 
both commercial and resi-
dential property transactions, 
and goes through practice and 
procedure from a property 
practitioner’s point of view.  
The authors use real life 
scenarios to show how the 
tax applies in different situa-
tions, and provide checklists 
and flowcharts wherever 
helpful.  All the SDLT forms 
with guidance on how to 
complete them, along with 
completed examples, is in-
cluded as are relevant parts 
of the Finance Acts 2003 and 
2004 as amended.
  
Equity  Release: A  Practi-
tioner’s Guide
by Jonathan Wilkey, Jordan 
Publishing, Paperback, ISBN 
0-85308-958-2, due February 
2006, c.£50.00
The equity release market 
is one of the fastest grow-
ing sectors of the financial 
services industry.  Unlocking 
money from homes to sup-

port low incomes has proven 
to be an attractive option 
especially in times of falling 
stock markets, low interest 
rates and under-performing 
pension schemes.  
Lawyers and financial advis-
ers need to be aware of the 
legal framework in which 
such equity release schemes 
operate.  This new guide 
provides a comprehensive 
review of the various types 
of schemes available; ad-
vice on the professional and 
practical issues surrounding 
such schemes; an insight into 
how such schemes can be 
used to mitigate inheritance 
tax, pay for residential care, 
fund speculative investment, 
and help settle matrimonial 
settlements; and an examina-
tion of the safety procedures 
in force to protect clients in-
cluding those of the FSA and 
various Codes of Conduct.  

The WTO Anti-Dumping 
Agreement: A  Commen-
tary
by Edwin Vermulst, Oxford 
University Press, Hardback, 
ISBN 0-19-927707-9, due 
December 2005, c.£75.00
The Anti-Dumping Agree-
ment is often perceived as 
being the most technical 
and controversial WTO 
agreement. While the basic 
concepts of dumping and 
resulting injury may appear 
deceptively simple, complex 
methodology related to the 
calculation of dumping and 
injury margins, as well as 
the very detailed procedural 
requirements that authorities 
need to comply with before 
taking anti-dumping action, 

make the Anti-Dumping 
Agreement difficult to apply 
and understand in practice. 
While the book of necessity 
goes into great detail about 
the intricacies of anti-dump-
ing law and practice, it at-
tempts to explain the various 
concepts in a relatively non-
technical manner by means 
of simplified examples that 
are easy to grasp for experts 
and non-experts alike. The 
book also pays extensive at-
tention to interpretations of 
the various provisions of the 
Anti-Dumping Agreement by 
WTO panels and the Appel-
late Body. There have been 
more WTO cases under the 
Anti-Dumping Agreement 
than under any other WTO 
Agreement, reflecting both 
the increased recourse to 
anti-dumping measures by 
WTO members all over the 
world and the complexity of 
abiding by the WTO rules. 
WTO Panels and the Ap-
pellate Body, called upon 
to review administrative 
determinations and aspects 
of national legislation, have 
done a remarkable job in in-
terpreting the WTO rules. For 
WTO members, wishing to 
impose anti-dumping meas-
ures in a WTO-consistent 
manner, knowledge not only 
of the Agreement itself, but 
also of such interpretations, 
is therefore a must.  
 
International  Copyright 
and Neighbouring Rights:
The Berne Convention and 
Beyond, �nd edition
by Sam Ricketson and Jane 
Ginsburg, Oxford University 
Press, Hardback, 2 volumes, 
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ISBN 0-19-825946-8, due 
December 2005, c.£225.00
This magisterial commentary 
deals both with the history 
and with the modern appli-
cation of the major interna-
tional agreements affecting 
copyright and related rights. 
In particular, it analyses the 
interpretation and application 
of the following conventions: 
the Berne Convention for the 
Protection of Literary and 
Artistic Works 1886-1970, 
the Rome Convention for 
the Protection of Performers, 
Phonogram Producers and 
Broadcasting Organisations 
1961, the WIPO Copyright 
and Performances and Pho-
nograms Treaties 1996 and 
the TRIPS Agreement (so 
far as it affects copyright and 
related rights). The organiza-
tion of the text separates his-
torical review from doctrinal 
analysis of the current appli-
cation of the Berne Conven-
tion’s provisions. The latter 
exposes gaps and ambiguities 
in the current text and, in a 
third section to each of the 
central chapters, considers 
the extent to which subse-
quent international instru-
ments have resolved those 
questions. Issues concerning 
new technologies and digital 
networks thus receive in-
depth treatment. The authors 
analyse questions of subject 
matter coverage, copyright 
ownership, duration, nature 
and scope of rights, and 
exceptions and limitations 
to copyrights protection. 
Extensive analysis of private 
international law matters also 
figures prominently in this 
edition, with two chapters 

devoted to problems of in-
ternational jurisdiction and 
choice of law. The book con-
tains a helpful compilation of 
relevant treaties and related 
materials, while a compan-
ion website to the book will 
supplement these with a 
collection of the travaux 
preparatoires of the Berne 
Convention itself.  

Tol ley’s   Employment 
Handbook ��th edition
by 11 King’s Bench Walk 
Chambers
LexisNexis Tolley, Paper-
back, ISBN 0-7545-2881-
2, Due December 2005, c. 
£86.00
Tolley’s Employment Hand-
book is written in a clear, 
highly accessible style, cov-
ering every aspect of em-
ployment law. The handbook 
is designed to assist you with 
every query you may have 
on routine subjects, such 
as maternity benefits and 
recruitment, and to provide 
expert guidance on more 
sensitive areas of the law 
such as sex discrimination 
and redundancy. The new 
19th edition is up-to-date 
with all recent changes in 
employment law and will 
help you understand exactly 
how these developments af-
fect you, your company, your 
employees or your clients. 

The Regulation of Interna-
tional  Financial  Markets: 
Perspectives for Reform
Edited by Rainer Grote and 
Thilo Marauhn, Cambridge 
University Press, Hardback, 
ISBN 0-521-83144-X, due 
January 2006, c. £55.00

International financial rela-
tions have become increas-
ingly important for the devel-
opment of global and national 
economies. At present these 
relations are primarily gov-
erned by market forces, with 
little regulatory interference 
at the international level. In 
the light of numerous finan-
cial crises, this abstinence 
must be seriously questioned. 
Starting with an analysis 
of the regulatory problems 
at the international level, 
with only minimal powers 
entrusted to international 
organisations, this book de-
velops various possibilities 
for reform. On the basis of an 
historical analysis, the book 
first adopts a comparative 
approach to national attempts 
to regulate international fi-
nancial markets, then out-
lines the potential of relevant 
institutions (such as the Eu-
ropean Central Bank, Basel 
Committee, IMF and World 
Bank) and finally develops a 
policy perspective. It seeks to 
provide a framework for ana-
lysing options for the regula-
tion of international financial 
markets, from a public inter-
national law and comparative 
law perspective. 

Employment  Tribunal 
Compensation, �rd edition
by Anthony Korn and Mo-
hinderpal Sethi, Oxford Uni-
versity Press, Paperback, 
ISBN 0-19-928811-9, Due 
December 2005 c.£45.00
Over recent years the juris-
diction of the Employment 
Tribunal has increased dra-
matically - the vast major-
ity of employment claims 
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are now brought here. And 
as the value of claims has 
increased, so too has the 
complexity of compensa-
tion awards and agreements 
- legal advisers now routinely 
need to advise on tax and 
pensions issues. Develop-
ments in employment law 
- notably in discrimination 
law - have also increased 
the range of actions brought. 
This new edition provides 
a comprehensive, practical 
and accessible guide to the 
financial awards available for 
every type of claim brought 
to the Tribunal, including 
wrongful dismissal, unfair 
dismissal, redundancy, dis-
crimination, equal pay and 
claims for unpaid wages. 
Based on Anthony Korn’s 
well regarded text Compen-
sation for Dismissal, this new 
edition has been designed 
with the Tribunal practitioner 
in mind and has been sub-
stantially revised to include 
a detailed new section on 
discrimination compensation 
as well as a fully updated 
section on compensation for 
unfair dismissal (including a 
chapter on compensation for 
loss of pension rights written 
by Raymond Jeffers, Head 
of the London Employment 
Group at Linklaters).  The 
book provides a detailed 
analysis of the principles 
underlying Employment Tri-
bunal awards, and their con-
tinuing development as well 
as comprehensive coverage 
of recent case law includ-
ing decisions relating to the 
calculation of future loss, 
the relevance of the Ogden 
tables, and the reduction 

of damages for contribu-
tory fault in unfair dismissal 
claims, and changes brought 
about since implementation 
of the dispute resolution 
procedures under the Em-
ployment Act 2002. Spe-
cific practical guidance on 
award calculation (includ-
ing worked examples), case 
preparation and evidence, 
Tribunal procedure, settle-
ment negotiations and tax 
liabilities is also included.
The book is accompanied by 
a regularly updated compan-
ion website. 

International Tax Law 
by Professor Andrea Ama-
tucci, Kluwer Law Interna-
tional, Hardback, ISBN 90-
411-2390-3, due December 
2005, c.£84.00
With a century of solid the-
ory behind it, tax law at the 
threshold of the twenty-first 
century confronts a new 
reality: the weakening of 
the tenacious link between 
the sovereignty of states 
and taxation. Yet it is to the 
continuity of certain themes 
and principles inherent in 
the various national tax sys-
tems that tax law scholarship 
continues to look, even as 
it develops new principles 
designed to meet the expand-
ing processes of nternation-
alisation. This collection 
of eleven essays offers an 
expert comparative analysis, 
conducted by a sample of 
the best international tax law 
scholars, of the fundamental 
theory of tax law and of the 
prospects in the near future of 
tax legislative systems. The 
emphasis falls naturally on 

tax theory, jurisprudence, and 
legislative development in 
the Member States of the Eu-
ropean Union (particularly in 
Italy, Germany, and Spain), 
where the process of tax 
harmonisation has been un-
der way for many years. The 
effect of these processes, via 
the relevant tax treaties, on 
the tax systems of Japan and 
the United States provides a 
secondary emphasis. Practi-
tioners and academics in tax 
law will find in this book an 
invaluable understanding of 
the challenges that tax law 
theory strives to meet at this 
crucial moment of economic 
history. The essays present a 
full and reliable exposition 
of the current theoretical 
approaches adopted by the 
various schools of thought 
in the field, as well as of 
the main contributions of 
jurisprudence. Extensive bib-
liographies are included. This 
volume translates and sum-
marizes material in the editor 
s major five-volume work 
Trattato di diritto tributario 
(1994). Professor Amatucci 
has added an important new 
preface. 

Privacy and the Press, �nd 
edition
by Dudley Moore, XPL Pub-
lishing, Paperback, ISBN 1-
85811-367-9, Due December 
2005, c. £38.00
The purpose of this book 
is to consider whether the 
existing law in England and 
Wales is adequate to protect 
the privacy of the individual 
against the intrusion by the 
press.  The nature and extent 
of existing protection and 
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what alternatives there may 
be is considered thoroughly. 
Press intrusion and its general 
behaviour receive particular 
attention through sections on 
the Press Complaints Com-
mission, its Code of Practice 
and whether self-regulation 
is favourable over legisla-
tive control. Various existing 
laws are discussed to estab-
lish whether or not they are 
adequate to protect privacy: 
confidentiality, with a refer-
ence to the equitable origins 
and its modern day criteria.  
It is very much a case-by-
case distinction with an em-
phasis on the public interest 
defence but confidentiality is 
probably the closest protec-
tion of privacy that we have 
at the present.  Copyright is 
also considered, with regard 
to the written word (per-
sonal letters) and the spoken 
word (interviews). Also the 
intrusion by publication of 
photographs is a matter that 
is raised.  There are various 
common law remedies that 
may protect privacy, such as 
nuisance, but this has limita-
tions. Some of these may 
have been resolved by statute. 
There will be a consideration 
of other existing legal aspects 
possibly protecting privacy, 
concluding that the general 
assumption that there is no 
actual law of privacy. This is 
not intended to be a substitute 
for a textbook on Tort.
Future legal developments 
will be addressed with an 
outline of how the Human 
Rights Act will work and an 
examination of whether it 
will affect the press and pri-
vacy.  Particular considera-

tion will be given to the task 
of the judiciary to balance 
freedom of expression with 
the right to privacy.  This 
new edition should be useful 
reading for the press, lawyers 
advising the press and those 
that need protection from 
the press.

Licensing Law Handbook: 
A practical guide to liquor 
and  entertainment  licens-
ing
by Russell Hewitson, Law 
Society Publishing, Paper-
back, ISBN 1 85328 954 
X, due December 2005, 
c.£49.95
The Licensing Act 2003 has 
introduced major reforms to 
licensing law and procedure. 
There is now a completely 
new scheme for licensing the 
sale and supply of alcohol, 
the provision of regulated en-
tertainment and the provision 
of late night refreshment. The 
Licensing Law Handbook is 
a concise guide to the new 
law and procedures. It con-
tains the essential informa-
tion that a practitioner will 
need in order to answer day 
to day questions.  It provides 
a detailed and clear expla-
nation of the new system 
of licensing, including: the 
nature of the various forms of 
authorisation for licensable 
activities under the Act, how 
to apply for an authorisation, 
the forms to use, operating 
schedules, how to object 
to an application, offences, 
closure powers, and appeals. 
The Handbook includes cop-
ies of the main Regulations 
made under the Act and 
extracts from the Secretary 

of State’s Guidance. The 
Licensing Law Handbook 
should be the first choice for 
any practitioner seeking up 
to date guidance on licensing 
practice.

Justice for Crimes against 
Humanity 
Edited by Mark Lattimer 
and Philippe Sands, Hart 
Publishing, Paperback, ISBN 
1-84113-568-2, due February 
2005, c.£25.00
The aim of this book is to 
assess recent developments 
in international law seeking 
to bring an end to impunity 
by bringing to justice those 
accused of war crimes and 
crimes against humanity. 
The book was originally con-
ceived while the editors were 
engaged, in different capaci-
ties, in proceedings relating 
to the detention of Senator 
Pinochet in London. The vig-
orous public debate that at-
tended that case - and related 
developments in international 
criminal justice, such as the 
creation of the International 
Criminal Court and the trial 
of former President Milose-
vic – demonstrate the close 
connections between the law 
and wider political or moral 
questions. In the field of in-
ternational criminal justice 
there appeared, therefore, 
a clear need to distinguish 
legal from essentially po-
litical issues - promoting the 
application of the law in an 
impartial and apolitical man-
ner - while at the same time 
enabling each to legitimately 
inform the development of 
the other.
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New:
IMPLEMENTATION OF THE WTO AGREEMENTS IN CHINA

Edited by Xin Zhang
ISBN 1-898029-79-2

Hardback, 396pp
£65

The implementation of the WTO Agreements in China has raised great international interest 
as a result of China’s increasing importance in the world economy and the unprecedented 
wide range of accession commitments that China has assumed. This book researches the 
legal institutions, mechanisms and processes for the WTO implementation in China dur-
ing more than three years of accession (up to 1 May 2005) and proposes legal solutions to 
improve the implementation status. 

Dr. Zhang’s study should significantly enhance the understanding of the interaction between 
China’s legal and regulatory reforms and the WTO implementation. It provides key infor-
mation to both policy makers and practitioners who are interested in this area. Moreover, 
by analysing key issues in the WTO implementation process in the Chinese case, his work 
throws new light on important areas of international economic law.
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New:
SIR THOMAS MORE LECTURE 2003
THE RIGHT TO HUMAN DIGNITY

Editor Ian Mason
ISBN: 1898029741
Paperback 150pp

£15.95
Includes papers by Paul Heim, Tim Eicke, Thomas Sharpe, Gabriel Moss, 

and Hans Christian Kruger
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NEW:
FORGING A COMMON LEGAL DESTINY

Liber Amicorum in honour of William E. Butler
with

INTERNATIONAL AND COMPARATIVE LAW
A Bibliography of the writings of William E. Butler

General Editor A. L. Kolodkin
ISBN:1898029784 and 189802975X

Russian & English texts
Hardback 2 vols 900pp & 308pp

£65 the set
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WILDy, SIMMONDS & HILL 
PuBLICATIONS

Paperless Securities
V. A. Belov
£45.00  2003
ISBN 1898029644

Comparative Law
Saidov, A.Kh.
£65.00    2003
ISBN: 1898029636

Chinese Maritime Law and 
Arbitration
Beaumont, B. and Yang, P.
£35 1994
ISBN: 1898029032

Chinese International Com-
mercial Arbitration
Beaumont, B. and Marcus, H.
£35 1994
ISBN: 1898029040

Commentary on the Chinese 
Arbitration Act
Beaumont, B., Choi, D. and 
Luk, J.
£35 1995
ISBN: 1898029156

Criminal Code of the Russian 
Federadtion 4th edn
Butler, W.E.
£65 2004
ISBN: 1898029660

Economic Code of Ukraine
Butler, W.E.
£65 2004
ISBN: 1898029678

Sudebnik
Butler, W.E. (editor)
£180 per year – 4 issues
1996–
ISSN: 1362-3710

Tadzhikistan Legal Texts
Butler, W.E.
£25 1999
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